
 

  

     
 

 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 21-123 6th April 2021 
 

 

1. How many members of staff have you offered a Covid vaccine to? 
The Health Board does not hold a record of staff offered a vaccine 

 
2. How many of those have had their first vaccine?    

As of 31st March 2021 = 20,372* 
 

3. How many have had their second vaccine?   

As of 31st March 2021 = 18,065* 

4. Of those offered the vaccine, how many have declined?  

The Health Board does not hold a record of staff who have declined the 

vaccine 

5. Of those who declined, do you have a record of their reasons. If so 
what are they?   

Please refer to Q4. 

Of those who declined, what are their position? 

(doctor/nurse/porter/clerk etc)  
Please refer to Q4. 

 
* Please note these figures include all healthcare staff including those who do 

not work directly for the Health Board and may be employed by a GP practice or 
other primary care contractor. 

 


