
 

  

     
 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 23-164 24th April 2023 
 

 

I would be very grateful if you could provide me, under the Freedom of 

Information Act, information with respect to the following by each 
hospital within your trust, please reply on the attached excel document: 

 
LIMS (Laboratory information management system) 

 
For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 

a.  Who is your current LIMS (Laboratory information management 
system) provider? 

 Intersystems 
 

I.  What is the overall contract value? 
 The Health Board does not hold this information, the system was 

procured by Digital Health & Care Wales (DHCW), therefore you will 
need to contact them direct. 

II.  What is the tenure/length of the contract? 

 Please refer to QaI 
 

b.  Who was the provider under the previous LIMS (Laboratory 
information management system) contract? 

 Royal Gwent Hospital – The Computer Sciences Corporation (CSC) 
 Nevill Hall Hospital - CliniSys 

I.  What was the tenure /length of the contract? 
 Unknown – pre 2011 

 
c.  When did you first implement a LIMS (Laboratory information 

management system) at each hospital within your trust? 
 Unknown 

 
RIS (Radiology Information System)  

 

For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 
a.   Who is your current RIS (Radiology Information System) provider? 

RadIS 
I.    What is the overall contract value?  

 SLA cost for 2022/23 is £63,213  
 

II.   What is the tenure/length of the contract?  
RadIS has been the RIS since the 1980’s which was a greenscreen 

version of RadIS1, then RadIS 2 with the current version of RadIS in 
2008. 

 
b.    Who was the provider under the previous RIS (Radiology 

information system) contract?  

https://dhcw.nhs.wales/


 Always used RadIS 

 
I.    What was the tenure /length of the contract?  

 N/A 
 

c.    When did you first implement a RIS (Radiology information 
system) at each hospital within your trust?  

 1980’s 
 

PACS (Picture archiving and communication system)  
 

For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 

a.    Who is your current PACS (Picture archiving and communication 
system) provider? 

 Fujifilm 
 

I.    What is the overall contract value?  
 £829,740  

II.  What is the tenure / length of the contract?  
 Ends February 2025 

 
b.    Who was the provider under the previous PACS (Picture information 

and communication system) contract?  
 The Health Board has only used Fujifilm PACS since 2005 

 
I.    What was the tenure/length of the contract?  

 2005-2014 Fujifilm.  

 Following this Fujifilm won the national PACS contract for every Health 
Board in Wales. 

 
c.    When did you first implement a PACS (Picture information and 

communication system) at each hospital within your trust?  
 2005 

 
OIS (Oncology information system) 

 
For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 

a.  Who is your current OIS (Oncology information system) 
  provider? 

 Digital Health & Care Wales 
 

I.    What is the overall contract value?  

 The Health Board does not hold this information, the system was 
procured by Digital Health & Care Wales (DHCW), therefore you will 

need to contact them direct. 
 

II.   What is the tenure / length of the contract?  
 Please refer to QaI 

 
b.    Who was the provider under the previous OIS (Oncology 

information system) contract?  
 Please refer to QaI 

https://dhcw.nhs.wales/


 I.    What was the tenure/length of the contract?  

  Please refer to QaI  
 

c.     When did you first implement an OIS (Oncology information 
system) at each hospital within your trust?  

 Please refer to QaI 
 

MIS (Maternity information system)  
 

For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 
a.  Who is your current MIS (Maternity information system) provider? 

DEDULAS ( previously called CSC)  

 
I.   What is the overall contract value?  

 £13K per year  
II.   What is the tenure / length of the contract?  

 Ending May 2023  
 

b.    Who was the provider under the previous MIS (Maternity 
information system) contract?  

 PROTOS  
I.    What was the tenure/length of the contract?  

 The Health Board does not hold this information.  
 

c.   When did you first implement a MIS (Maternity information 
system) at each hospital within your trust?  

 Approximately 2004  
 

PIS (Pharmacy information system)  
 

For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 
a.  Who is your current PIS (Pharmacy information system) provider? 

CareFlow Medicines Management Pharmacy Stock Management System 
 

I.  What is the overall contract value? The Health Board does not hold 
this information, the system was procured by Digital Health & Care 

Wales (DHCW), therefore you will need to contact them direct. 
 

II.  What is the tenure / length of the contract?  
  Please refer to QaI  

 
b.  Who was the provider under the previous PIS (Pharmacy 

information system) contract?  

 Please refer to QaI  
 

I.  What was the tenure/length of the contract?  
  Please refer to QaI  

 
c.  When did you first implement a PIS (Pharmacy information system) 

at each hospital within your trust? 
Royal Gwent Hospital and Grange University Hospital – November 2020 

Ysbyty Ystrad Fawr and Nevill Hall Hospital - Jan/Feb 2021 

https://dhcw.nhs.wales/
https://dhcw.nhs.wales/


 

NIS (Nurse information system) 
 

For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 
 

a.  Who is your current NIS (Nurse information system) provider? 
 Welsh Nursing Care Records 

 
I.  What is the overall contract value? 

The Health Board does not hold this information, the system was 
procured by Digital Health & Care Wales (DHCW), therefore you will 

need to contact them direct. 

   
II.  What is the tenure / length of the contract? 

 Please refer to QaI 
 

b.  Who was the provider under the previous NIS (Nurse information 
system) contract? 

 Please refer to QaI  
 

I.  What was the tenure/length of the contract? 
  Please refer to QaI  

 
c.  When did you first implement a NIS (Nurse information system) at 

each hospital within your trust? 
 Please refer to QaI  

 

CIS (Clinical information system) 
 

For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 
a.  Who is your current CIS (Clinical information system) provider?  

 Welsh Clinical Portal 

I.  What is the overall contract value?  

 N/A 
II.  What is the tenure / length of the contract?  

 N/A 
 

b.  Who was the provider under the previous CIS (Clinical information 
system) contract? Internally Developed & Maintained System 

 
 I.  What was the tenure/length of the contract?  

  N/A 

 
c.  When did you first implement a CIS (Clinical information system) at 

each hospital within your trust? 
 N/A 

 
FIS (Financial information system)  

Integrated FMS Service  
 

For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 
a.  Who is your current FIS (Financial information system) provider? 

https://dhcw.nhs.wales/


I.  What is the overall contract value? 

 The Health Board does not hold this information, the system is hosted 
 by NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP), therefore you will 

 need to contact them direct. 
 

II.  What is the tenure / length of the contract? 
 Please refer to QIa 

 
b.  Who was the provider under the previous FIS (Financial information 

system) contract? 
Please refer to QIa 

 

I.  What was the tenure/length of the contract? 
 Please refer to QIa 

 
c.  When did you first implement a FIS (Financial information system) 

at each hospital within your trust? 
Please refer to QIa 

 
BBIS (Blood bank information system) 

 
For each hospital within your trust, please provide: 

a.  Who is your current BBIS (Blood bank information system) 
provider? 

 CliniSys 
 

I.  What is the overall contract value? 

£991K  
 

II. What is the tenure / length of the contract? 
 3 years 

 
b.  Who was the provider under the previous BBIS (Blood bank 

information system) contract? 
 Royal Gwent Hospital - The Computer Sciences Corporation (CSC) 

 
I.  What was the tenure/length of the contract? 

 Unknown 
 

c.  When did you first implement a BBIS (Blood bank information 
system) at each hospital within your trust? 

 Unknown. 
 


