
 

  

     
 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 23-381 11 August 2023 
 

 

Your request 

You requested the following: 

 

Please can you provide information on the following points regarding NHS dentistry: 

 

1. The number of people that are currently on a waiting list to register at an NHS General 

Dental Service provider within the health board, providing a breakdown of how many are: 

a. Adults 

b. Children 

 

2. The number of people that are currently on a waiting list to register at a Community 

Dental Service provider within the health board, providing a breakdown of how many are 

a. Adults 

b. Children 

 

3. The number of people that are on an NHS Community Dental Service waiting list to 

receive treatment, providing a breakdown of how many are: 

a. Adults 

b. Children 

 

4. The number of adults who are currently on an NHS General Dental Service waiting list to 

receive treatment, and have been waiting for: 

a. up to 1 month 

b. 1-3 months 

c. 3-6 months 

d. 6-12 months 

e. 12-18 months 

f. 18-24 months 

g. 24 months+ 

 

5. The number of children who are currently on an NHS General Dental Service waiting list 

to receive treatment, and have been waiting for: 

a. up to 1 month 

b. 1-3 months 

c. 3-6 months 

d. 6-12 months 

e. 12-18 months 

f. 18-24 months 

g. 24 months+ 

 

 



Our response 

 

1. We do not hold the information requested in points 1a and 1b. You may wish to direct 

your request to the individual practices as the waiting lists are held by them. 

Dentist - Aneurin Bevan University Health Board (nhs.wales) 

 

2. We do not hold the information requested in points 2a and 2b as we do not have a central 

wating list for this service. Our Community Dental Service does not register patients as it 

is a referral-only service.  

3. We do not hold the information requested in points 3a and 3b as we do not have a central 

wating list for this service. Our Community Dental Service does not register patients as it 

is a referral-only service. 

4. We do not hold the information requested for points 4a-4g. You may wish to direct your 

request to the individual practices as the waiting lists are held by them. 

Dentist - Aneurin Bevan University Health Board (nhs.wales) 

 

5. We do not hold the information requested for points 5a-5g. You may wish to direct your 

request to the individual practices as the waiting lists are held by them. 

Dentist - Aneurin Bevan University Health Board (nhs.wales) 

https://abuhb.nhs.wales/healthcare-services/gps-dentists-etc/dentist/
https://abuhb.nhs.wales/healthcare-services/gps-dentists-etc/dentist/
https://abuhb.nhs.wales/healthcare-services/gps-dentists-etc/dentist/

