
 

  

     
 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 23-433 22 August 2023 
 

 

Your request 

You requested the following: 

 

1. Across Caerphilly County Borough, how many doctor's appointments have been missed 
at GP practices between January 1 2023 and August 1 2023? 

2. Across Caerphilly County Borough, how many nurse's appointments have been missed 
at GP practices between January 1 2023 and August 1 2023? 

 

Our response 

 

1. We do not hold this information and you may wish to direct your request to each 

individual practice within Caerphilly County Borough. 

2. We do not hold this information and you may wish to direct your request to each 

individual practice within Caerphilly County Borough. 

 


