
 

  

     
 

 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 21-476 9th December 2021 
 

 

1. Minutes and Microsoft Teams records of any Meeting of the Board of 
the Health Board regarding which specific NHS organisation should 

be the employer of the Local Public Health Team staff.  
 

There have been no discussions by the Board in relation to which specific 
NHS organisation should be the employer of the Local Public Health Team 

staff. 
 

2. Minutes and Microsoft Teams records of any executive or directorate 
level-discussions or meetings, that have taken place involving the 

Chief Executive (CEO) of the Health Board or / and any Executive 
Director of the Health Board, covering which specific NHS 

organisation should be the employer of the Local Public Health Team 
staff.  

 

We have undertaken a review and do not hold any minutes or recordings of 
meetings between the CEO and any other Executive Director regarding which 

NHS organisation should be the employer of the Local Public Health Team. 
 

3. Any written correspondence – including (but not limited to) emails - 
between the CEO of the Health Board and any Executive Director of 

the Health Board, covering which specific NHS organisation should be 
the employer of the Local Public Health Team staff. 

 
We have undertaken a review and do not hold any information between the 

CEO and any other Executive Director regarding which NHS organisation 
should be the employer of the Local Public Health Team. 

 
4. Minutes and Microsoft Teams records of any executive level 

discussions or meetings, that have taken place involving the CEO 

or/and any Executive Director of the Health Board with any of the 
CEOs or Executive Directors of other NHS Wales organisations 

(including, but not limited to, the CEO or / and any Executive Director 
of any of the other 6 Health Boards in Wales or / and the CEO or any 

Executive Director of Public Health Wales or/and the CEO of NHS 
Wales) covering which specific NHS organisation should be the 

employer of the Local Public Health Team staff. 
 

We have undertaken a review and do not hold any minutes or recordings of 
meetings at an executive level regarding which NHS organisation should be 

the employer of the Local Public Health Team. 
 



5. Any written correspondence – including (but not limited to) emails – 

between the CEO or/and any Executive Director of the Health Board 
and any of the CEOs or Executive Directors of other NHS Wales 

organisations (including, but not limited to, the CEO or / and any 
Executive Director of any of the other 6 Health Boards in Wales or / 

and the CEO or any Executive Director of Public Health Wales or/and 
the CEO of NHS Wales) covering which specific NHS organisation 

should be the employer of the Local Public Health Team staff.  
 

We have undertaken a review and do not hold any written correspondence 
between the CEO/Executive Directors and other NHS organisations regarding 

which NHS organisation should be the employer of the Local Public Health 

Team. 
 

6. Any written submissions (from whatever source) provided to the NHS 
Wales CEO or to the Welsh Government’s Minister for Health and 

Social Care (which were shared with either the Health Board CEO or 
any Executive Director of the Health Board) about which specific NHS 

organisation should be the employer of the Local Public Health Team 
staff. 

 
 Please find, at Attachment One, copy of a letter sent to Dr Andrew Goodall, 

Director General for Health and Social Services and Chief Executive of NHS 
Wales from Dr Tracey Cooper, Chief Executive, Public Health Wales. 

 


