

Freedom of Information Request	FOI 21-051	23 rd February 2021
in ceacin of information request	10121001	

1. On what date was the first prisoner at HMP Usk vaccinated against coronavirus?

The first prisoner at HMP Usk to be vaccinated was on the 14th January 2021.

2. On what date was the first prisoner at HMP Prescoed vaccinated against coronavirus?

The first prisoner at HMP Prescoed to be vaccinated was on the 10th February 2021.

3. On what date was the first prisoner in Wales vaccinated against coronavirus? At what location?

Whilst the Health Board does not hold this information we understand that the first prisoner vaccinated in Wales was the individual at HMP Usk on 14th January 2021 (this information was provided by HMPPS which collects and collates this information)

Have all over-80 prisoners now been vaccinated at 4. Usk/Prescoed/other Welsh prisons? As of what date? We can only provide information relevant to the prison in the Aneurin Bevan University Health Board area as follows:

Three (3) over-80 prisoners were vaccinated on 14th January 2021. One (1) over-80 prisoner was vaccinated on 10th February 2021 as they were feeling unwell on 14th January 2021.

There are no prisoner's over-80 at HMP Prescoed.

Have vaccinations of prisoners aged between 70 and 79 started? as 5. of what date?

All men within that cohort were offered the vaccine as of 10th February 2021

- Will the vaccination of prisoners in the top four groups as defined by 6. the JCVI be completed by the Government's deadline of mid-Feb? Yes – all prisoners within the top four groups will have been offered the vaccination.
- 7. Roughly how many prisoners aged over 80 are there in Wales? The Health Board does not hold this information. You would need to contact the Prison Service direct via https://www.gov.uk/government/organisations/hm-prison-service