
 

  

     
 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 23-039 13th February 2023 
 

 

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I am writing to obtain the 

following details in relation to your use of couriers, taxis, and non-
patient transport services please: 

 
1. The amount spent on courier/taxi/non-patient transport services in 

each of the following financial years: 
• 2021-22         £386,245  

• 2020-21         £301,928 
• 2019-20         £281,904 

• 2018-19         £1,775,113 
• 2017-18         £1,338,242 

 
2. A breakdown of the amount spent on taxis and courier services by 

department (for example pathology, pharmacy, sterile services, 
medical records etc) in each of the following financial years: 

The Health Board does not hold this level of detail. 

• 2021-22 
• 2020-21 

• 2019-20 
• 2018-19 

• 2017-18 
 

3. A breakdown of the amount spent on taxis and courier services by 
reason for spend (for equipment, specimens, medicine etc) in each 

of the following financial years: 
The Health Board does not hold this level of detail. 

• 2021-22 
• 2020-21 

• 2019-20 
• 2018-19 

• 2017-18 

 
4. The name of your courier/taxi/non-patient transport services 

suppliers 
Courier services  

NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership (NWSSP) 
 

Taxi services 
Veezu and Sheila’s Taxis  

 
5. The annual value of your courier/taxi/non-patient transport 

services suppliers’ contracts 
NWSSP deal with the procurement of these services. Therefore, you will 

need to direct your request to them.  

https://nwssp.nhs.wales/


 

6. The expiry dates of your courier/taxi/non-patient transport services 
suppliers’ contracts 

Please refer to Q5. 
 

7. The name of the framework(s) used to procure your 
courier/taxi/non-patient transport services suppliers’ contracts 

Please refer to Q5. 
 

8. The total cost of the courier/taxi/non-patient transport services 
that are not outsourced but are managed in-house 

Nil. 

 
9. The number of staff employed in managing the in-house contracts 

One. 
 

10. The number of vehicles either owned or leased to meet the in house 
courier requirements 

Nil. 
 

11. The name(s) and email(s) of the person(s) responsible for the 
management of courier/taxi/non-patient transport services 

 Please refer to Q5. 
 

12. The name(s) and email(s) of the person(s) responsible for the 
procurement of courier/taxi/non-patient transport services 

 Please refer to Q5. 

 


