
 

  

     
 

 
 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 22-596 4th January 2022 
 

 
I am analysing the treatment of dermatological conditions in the UK. 

Could you please answer the following questions. 
 

Q1. How many patients were treated in last 4 months by the 

Dermatology department with each of the following: 
The Health Board is unable to provide information on the number of patients 

treated with specific drugs, however, please find below the quantities 
dispensed, across Health Board pharmacies for dermatology only for the 

period August 2022 – November 2022: 
 

• Abrocitinib 

• Acitretin 

• Alitretinoin 

• Azathioprine 

• Baricitinib 

• Ciclosporin 

• Dupilumab 

• Methotrexate 

• Mycophenolate mofetil 

• Pimecrolimus 

• Tacrolimus ointment 

• Tralokinumab 

• Upadacitinib 

• Phototherapy (UVB or PUVA) 

 

Type Quantity 

DUPILUMAB (DUPIXENT) 200 mg in 1.14mL Pre-Filled Pen 2 Pre-
Filled Pen Pack 

6 

DUPILUMAB (DUPIXENT) 200 mg in 1.14mL Pre-Filled Syringe 2 

Pre-Filled Syringe Pack 
9 

DUPILUMAB (DUPIXENT) 300 mg in 2mL Pre-Filled Pen 2 Pre-Filled 

Pen Pack 
130 

DUPILUMAB (DUPIXENT) 300 mg in 2mL Pre-Filled Syringe 2 Pre-
Filled Syringe Pack 

87 

METHOTREXATE (METOJECT) 10 mg in 0.2mL Pre-Filled Pen 1 Pre-
Filled Pen Pack 

8 

METHOTREXATE (METOJECT) 12.5 mg in 0.25mL Pre-Filled Pen 1 

Pre-Filled Pen Pack 
3 

 

  



 

Q2. Of the patients treated in the last 4 months with any of the products 
listed in Q1, please provide the number of patients by the following 

age-groups:  

• Age 6-11  

• Age 12-17  

• Age 18 and above  

Please refer to Q1, the Health Board is unable to provide this information as 

it is not recorded centrally. 

 

Q3. If possible, could you please provide the number of patients treated 

in the last 4 months for atopic dermatitis ONLY with: 

• Azathioprine 

• Ciclosporin 

• Methotrexate 

• Mycophenolate mofetil 

• Phototherapy (UVB or PUVA) 

Please refer to Q1, the Health Board is unable to provide this information as 

it is not recorded centrally. 

 


