

Freedom of Information Request	FOI 22-246	20 <sup>th</sup> June 2022
--------------------------------	------------	----------------------------

# **1.** The total number of dental practices in your health board area There are 79 General Dental Contracts within the Heath Board area.

### The number and percentage of them:

### 2. accepting adult NHS patients

The Health Board does not hold this information. Dental Practices are independent contractors and therefore practices accepting NHS patients is managed at practice level.

# 3. accepting NHS child patients up to secondary school age (up to 16 years of age or 18 years of age if in full time education)

The Health Board does not hold this information. Dental Practices are independent contractors and therefore practices accepting NHS patients is managed at practice level.

The Community Dental Service accept referred children who meet the Aneurin Bevan University Health Board CDS criteria for referral.

# 4. accepting NHS child patients and young people with learning disabilities

The Health Board does not hold this information. Dental Practices are independent contractors and therefore practices accepting NHS patients is managed at practice level.

The Community Dental Service provide care for children and young people with learning disabilities who meet the Aneurin Bevan University Health Board CDS criteria for referral.

#### 5. accepting charge exempt NHS patients

The Health Board does not hold this information. Dental Practices are independent contractors and therefore practices accepting NHS patients is managed at practice level.

## 6. with a waiting list for NHS patients

Please refer to Q6.

### 7. accepting private patients

The Health Board does not hold information relating to private dentistry.

#### 8. with a waiting list for private patients

The Health Board does not hold information relating to private dentistry. Dental practices are independent contractors and private aspects of their business is managed by the practices.

9.	that are an NHS practice accepting private patients only Please refer to Q8.