
 

  

     
 

 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 21-077 8th March 2021 
 

 

Q1. How many patients were treated (for any condition) in the latest 6-

month period with the following drugs: 

• Juluca (rilpivirine/dolutegravir)  

• Dovato (lamivudine/dolutegravir)  
• Triumeq (abacavir/lamivudine/dolutegravir)  

• Tivicay (dolutegravir)  
• Isentress (raltegravir)  

• Biktarvy (TAF/emtricitabine/bictegravir)  

• Genvoya (TAF/emtricitabine/elvitegravir/cobisistat)  
• Symtuza (TAF/emtricitabine/darunavir/cobisistat)  

• Odefsey (TAF/emtricitabine/rilpivirine)  
• Descovy (TAF/emtricitabine)  

• Truvada or generic TDF/emtricitabine   
 

APPROVED NAME  DOSE FORM STRENGTH UNIT OF ISSUE 
QUANTITY 
ISSUED 

ODEFSEY TABLET 200mg/25mg/25mg 1 X 30 TABLETS 410 

BIKTARVY TABLET 50mg/200mg/25mg 1 X 30 TABLETS 348 

GENVOYA TABLET 150mg/150mg/200mg/10mg 1 X 30 TABLETS 185 

DESCOVY TABLET 200mg /25mg 1 X 30 TABLETS 87 

DESCOVY TABLET 200mg/10mg 1 X 30 TABLETS 128 

SYMTUZA TABLET   1 X 30 TABLETS 114 

TRIUMEQ TABLET   1 X 30 TABLETS 155 

APPROVED NAME  DOSE FORM STRENGTH UNIT OF ISSUE 
QUANTITY 
ISSUED 

DOLUTEGRAVIR TABLET 50mg 1 X 30 TABLETS 118 

EMTRICITABINE WITH 
TENOFOVIR DISOPROXIL TABLET 200mg/245mg 1 X 30 TABS 1161 

RALTEGRAVIR TABLET 400mg 1 X 60 TABLETS 60 

RALTEGRAVIR TABLET 600mg 1 X 60 TABLETS 46 

DOLUTEGRAVIR WITH 
LAMIVUDINE TABLET 50mg / 300mg 1 X 30 TABLETS 24 

 

Q2. How many patients received any antiretroviral (ART) therapy for 
HIV treatment (excluding pre- exposure prophylaxis):  

• for the latest 6-month period  

• for the 6 months from July-December 2019  
We do not hold this information 

 
Q3. How many patients were treated in the latest 6-months period with 

Truvada or generic TDF/emtricitabine for:  
• HIV treatment  



• Pre-exposure prophylaxis (PrEP)  

We do not hold this information 
 

Q4. How many packs of Truvada or generic TDF/emtricitabine were 
dispensed in latest 6-month period for:  

• HIV treatment  
• Pre-exposure prophylaxis (PrEP)  

Please see Question 1 
 


