

Freedom of Information Request	FOI 21-118	24 th March 2021
--------------------------------	------------	-----------------------------

- 1. At what centres/locations in Wales are cerebral palsy children and adolescents (up to age of 18 years) treated with botulinum toxin for spasticity?
- a. If patients are referred to centres in England for botulinum toxin treatment please include these centres as well.

Patients are treated within the Health Board with referrals to Cardiff and Vale University Health Board.

- 2. How many unique cerebral palsy children/adolescents (up to age of 18 years) were treated with botulinum toxin for spasticity at each centre named in the response to question 1 in 2019 and 2020?
- a. If these data are unavailable how many unique cerebral palsy children/adolescents (up to age of 18 years) were seen for spasticity at each centre named in the response to question 1 in 2019 and 2020?
 - i. If unique data are or are not available please also provide the number of episodes or attendances.

The figures for inpatients/day cases are below, the Health Board does not hold information in relation to outpatient treatments:

2019	2020
13	1

In terms of numbers of children seen for spasticity – in physiotherapy we would see children for a wider range of reasons and not purely spasticity – it seems this may be requesting numbers for specifically spasticity type clinic which physiotherapy would not run or be part of in ABUHB.

Your request indicates relates specifically to spasticity; the Health Board does not hold data specifically for spasticity as the children are referred for a variety of reasons and does not hold a clinic specifically for spasticity.