

Freedom of Information Request	FOI 23-080	2 <sup>nd</sup> March 2023
--------------------------------	------------	----------------------------

This is an information request relating to referrals to the Welsh Gender Service.

Please include the information for each of the following financial years; 2019/20, 2020/21, 2021/22, 2022/23:

1. The number of patients who have been referred to the Welsh Gender Service within the remit of the health board. The Health Board does not hold this information. This service is provided by

The Health Board does not hold this information. This service is provided by <u>Cardiff & Vale University Health Board</u> therefore you will need to direct your request to them.

Of these, please also provide the following:

- 2. The number/percentage of patients who have been referred to the Welsh Gender Service who have psychiatric comorbidities

  Please refer to Q1.
- 3. The number/percentage of patients that have been referred to the Welsh Gender Service who have reported self-harm, or attempts at suicide in the past Please refer to Q1.

To be clear, I am not asking for any personal details/information about any of the patients sent. I am just looking for information on aggregate details.