
 

  

     
 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 23-112 20th March 2023 
 

 

In relation to St Cadoc’s Hospital, for the period between 1998 and 

2001, please provide any of the following documents you hold: 
 

a. Any asbestos registers and/or management plans relating to 
asbestos in existence on this site; 

The Health Board does not hold any of such documents during this period. 
 

b. Any other records the council holds in relation to asbestos that 
would have been in existence on this site, for example asbestos 

databases; 
The Health Board does not hold any such database or register during this 

period. 
 

c. Asbestos management survey reports for the mentioned period, or, 
if any surveys were undertaken prior to 1998, the asbestos 

management survey closest in date to 01 January 1998 

Please see the attached documents. 
 

And 
 

d. Asbestos refurbishment/demolition survey reports. 
The Health Board does not hold any copies of such documents relating to 

the 1998-2001 period. However, there is a PCP pertaining to Asbestos at 
St Caodcs for this period which is attached. 

 


