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Under the Freedom of Information Act, please could you complete the
below FOI questions in relation to your organisation's Continuing
Healthcare (CHC) and Funded-Nursing Care (FNC).

1. What was your organisations total Continuing Healthcare (CHC) spend
for the following financial years:

19/20 (April 2019 to March 2020)

20/21 (April 2020 to March 2021)

£
19/20 (April 2019 to March 2020) 82,185,070
20/21 (April 2020 to March 2021) 93,071,332

2. How many eligible CHC cases did the organisation have at the end of
the following financial years:

19/20
20/21

Number
2019/2020 1,065
2020/2021 874

3. What was the average CHC conversion rate at the organisation in the
following years. Conversion rates measure the percentage of NHS CHC
assessments that result in eligibility for CHC

19/20
20/21
Communit Mental Health &
y Learning Disabilities
0/0 0/0
0,
2019/2020 Information not held 53%
2020/2021 100%

4. What was your organisations total Funded-Nursing Care (FNC) spend
for the following financial years:

19/20
20/21

£
2019/2020 7,693,351
2020/2021 8,659,929




5. How many eligible FNC cases did the organisation have at the end of
the following financial years:

19/20
20/21

Number
2019/2020 861
2020/2021 804

6. What was the average FNC conversion rate at the organisation in the
following years. Conversion rates measure the percentage of NHS FNC
assessments that result in eligibility for FNC

19/20

20/21

The Health Board does not hold this information.



