
 

  

     
 

 

 

Freedom of Information Request FOI 21-379 15th October 2021 
 

 

1. How many patients were administered (admitted) to the hospital, 
for each of the months below (2020). 

 

Jan Feb March April May June July Aug Sept Oct Nov Dec 

12,118 11,519 8,437 4,405 5,321 6,450 7,183 7,447 8,208 7,896 7,502 7,677 

 

2. How many patients that were administered to the hospital had 
received at least one covid-19 vaccine, for each of the months 

below?  
 

Jan  Feb March April May June July Aug Sept Oct Nov Dec 

      6 4 11 18 47 122 

 

3. How many patients that were administered to the hospital had NOT 
vaccinated against covid-19, for each of the months below. 

 

Jan Feb March April May June July Aug Sept Oct Nov Dec 

12,118 11,519 8,437 4,405 5,321 6,450 7,177 7,443 8,197 7,878 7,455 7,555 

 

4. How many patients that were administered to the hospital that had 

received at least one covid-19 vaccine died of any cause, for each of 
the months below. 

 

Jan Feb March April May June July Aug Sept Oct Nov Dec 

          3 6 

 

5. How many patients that were administered to the hospital that 

were NOT vaccinated against covid-19 died of any cause, for each 
of the months below. 

 

Jan Feb March April May June July Au Sept Oct Nov Dec 

267 230 294 261 138 167 204 190 222 299 275 374 
 

6. How many patients that were administered to the hospital that had 
received at least one covid-19 vaccine suffered a miscarriage, for 

each of the months below? 
 

The Health Board does not hold this information. 
 

7.  How many patients that were administered to the hospital that 
were NOT vaccinated against covid-19 suffered a miscarriage, for 

each of the months below?  
 

The Health Board does not hold this information. 

 



8. How many patients that were administered to ICU were vaccinated, 

for each of the months below? 
 

The Health Board does not hold this information. 
 

Please note: 
 

• The data includes admissions to ALL specialties, including mental health 
• The data includes inpatient, day case and regular day attender admissions 

• The data includes both elective and emergency admissions 
• The data includes patients who received their vaccination prior to being 

discharged from hospital (or on the day of discharge) and will include both 
patients vaccinated before being admitted and patients vaccinated whilst in 

hospital 

• As per previous, similar requests, we are not able to provide data for 
patients who died of COVID-19 

Patients receiving vaccinations prior to December 2020 were probably patients 
taking part in clinical trials as the rollout of vaccinations for COVID-19 did not 

start until December 2020 


