
 

  

     
 

 
Freedom of Information Request FOI 23-437 06 September 2023 

 

 

Your request 

You requested the following: 

 
Please provide the figures from 2013 - present, in calendar years not fiscal. 

 

1. How many members of staff have left their employment within the health board in order to 

live abroad? Can you please provide a breakdown of the job title of each employee prior 

to leaving?  

2. How many members of staff have left their employment within the health board in order to 

pursue employment in Australia? Can you please provide a breakdown of the job title of 

each employee prior to leaving? 

 

Our response 

 

1. We do not record this information centrally upon termination of employment. 

2. We do not record this information centrally upon termination of employment. 

 


